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5100 Student Rights  

5101 Student Expression 

The District will balance student speech and expression rights with its responsibility to 
provide a safe, orderly learning environment. 

Students may not engage in speech or expressive conduct that would materially and 
substantially interfere with or disrupt school operations, including school activities and 
educational programming. An actual disruption is not required before school officials may 
regulate student speech or impose discipline if they can reasonably forecast a substantial 
and material disruption or interference with school operations. 

Students may be disciplined for speech or expressive conduct that: is materially and 
substantially disruptive or that school officials can reasonably forecast will create a 
substantial disruption; is obscene, sexually explicit, indecent, or lewd; promotes the use 
of or advertises illegal substances; incites violence; contains “fighting words” or 
constitutes a true threat of violence; involves a student walkout; incites a violation of law, 
Board Policy, or rule; or is not constitutionally protected. Administrators will evaluate 
student speech on a case-by-case basis, including the location, context, and nexus to the 
school, before imposing discipline. 

Student activism is subject to the above standards. 

As used in this Policy, “fighting words” are words that tend to provoke a violent response 
amounting to a breach of the peace. 

Legal authority: U.S. CONST. amend. I; Const 1963, art I, § 5; Tinker v Des Moines Indep 
Community Sch Dist, 393 US 503 (1969) 

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 
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5102 Lockers 

Lockers are District property and may be made available for student use. Lockers are 
assigned to students on a temporary basis, and District administration may revoke a 
student’s locker assignment at any time. The District retains ownership of lockers 
notwithstanding student use. 

Students have no expectation of privacy in their lockers. The building principal or 
designee may inspect lockers without any particularized suspicion or reasonable cause 
and without advance notice. Upon the building principal or designee's request, law 
enforcement may help search lockers. 

During a locker search, student privacy rights will be respected for any items that are not 
illegal or against Board Policy. 

The Board directs the Superintendent to include this Policy in the student code of conduct 
and to distribute it to Parents. 

Legal authority: MCL 380.1306 

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 
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5103 Search and Seizure 

School officials may search a student and the student’s belongings if they have 
reasonable suspicion that the search will reveal contraband or evidence of a violation of 
law, Board Policy, or rule. In rare cases, school officials may conduct a search without 
reasonable suspicion if there is an imminent threat of physical harm or death. 

A reasonable suspicion search must be justified at its inception and reasonable in its 
scope. A search is justified at its inception when school officials have reasonable grounds 
to suspect that the search will uncover contraband or evidence of a violation of law, Policy, 
or rule. A search is reasonable in scope when the measures used are reasonably related 
to the search objectives and are not excessively intrusive in light of the student’s age and 
sex and the nature of the infraction. 

School officials are not required to have reasonable suspicion to search lockers or other 
District property. See Policy 5102. 

The District may use detection dogs to search for contraband on District property 
consistent with Policy 3107. 

A breath alcohol test is a search and may be administered upon reasonable suspicion 
that a student has consumed or is under the influence of alcohol. For voluntary, 
noncurricular school activities (e.g., school dances), suspicionless breath alcohol tests 
may be administered for student health and safety purposes if students and their Parents 
have been provided advance written notice. 

Strip searches are prohibited. 

The building principal or designee will turn over to law enforcement any confiscated 
dangerous weapons, as defined in Policy 5206. For all other confiscated contraband and 
evidence, the building principal or designee may turn the item over to law enforcement or 
store it in a secure place at school until a disciplinary hearing. 

This Policy does not apply to any outside entity that may require drug or breath alcohol 
testing as a condition of participation. See Policy 5105. 

Legal authority: MCL 380.1306, 380.1313(2) 

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 
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5104 Age of Majority 

State law recognizes students are adults at age 18 or when otherwise legally 
emancipated. Except as noted below, all Board Policies, applicable codes of conduct, 
and any other applicable rules or behavioral expectations apply to all students regardless 
of age. 

Unless inconsistent with a court order, students who are 18 years or older or legally 
emancipated may: 

A. access or control their student records as provided by law; 

B. make decisions related to special education and Section 504; 

C. request a personal curriculum; 

D. represent themselves during disciplinary conferences; 

E. have other rights or privileges as determined by the Superintendent or designee; 

F. sign themselves in and out of school; and 

G. provide reason(s) for their absences and tardies. 

Eligible students who wish to assert these rights must notify the building principal in 
writing. Otherwise, sections D-G above will not apply. The building principal or designee 
may notify an eligible student’s Parent that the eligible student has exercised the rights 
listed under this Policy. 

Legal authority: MCL 380.1278b; MCL 722.4, 722.52 

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 
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5105 Collaboration with Outside Entities 

The District may, from time to time, collaborate with outside entities to offer programming 
to students. Nothing in these Board Policies, including, without limitation, protocols for 
student searches and seizures, student discipline, interrogation of students, and 
seclusion and restraint, may be interpreted to interfere with any rule, regulation, or policy 
imposed by an outside entity with which the District cooperates or collaborates, except as 
otherwise prohibited by law. 

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 
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5106 Intentionally Left Blank 

Legal authority:  

Date adopted: June 25, 2025 

Date revised: 


